
Call Accounting Software TCT V2.5

    Features

Easy to install and use 
Universal Call Accounting 
format 
Allows TCT clients
Allows ACD clients
Diversity of reports
Customized reports
Recognizes international calls 
FIX and MOBILE
Edit dial number and CLIP
Recognizes all telecom 
providers
Integrates GROUP’s telephones 
Import / export Call Accounting
format 
Import / export  configuration 
Allows virtual extensions 
Allows charged extensions 
(extensions that belong to a 
account code)
External directory 
Allows to define departments 
and sub-departments
Collecting chart
On line call monitor
Alarms 
Licensing on the number of 
extensions 
Free upgrade (life time) 

          PBX simulator

 Built-in PBX simulator 
 Handy for presentation and configuration 
 Allows to do demonstration without a real 

connection to PBX
 Allows to add/edit extension, dial numbers/CLIPs 

and account codes 
 Generates SMDR information manual and 

automatic 
 Multi speeds generating



 
          TCT Reports 
 
 

Detail report
Total report 
Account code report 
Trunks report 
Departments report 
Charge trunks report 
Miscellaneous reports
Customized reports
TCT template report 
Default template report

 
          Deploy reports
 
 

 Allows 15 styles of 
predefined reports

 Allows basic filters 
 Allows additional filters 
 Allows conversion to other 

currency 
 Allows report correction

according to the telecom
invoice 

 Allows to add VAT
 Allows filters by department 
 Allows saving all filters 

applied 
 Allows to save customized 

report 



 
          TCT Client
 
 

TCP/IP connection
Personal on line call monitor 
Different colors for outgoing, 
incoming and missed calls
Allows reports

 

 
          ACD client 
 
 

TCP/IP connection
Personal an line call monitor 
Different colors for outgoing, 
incoming and missed calls
Allows reports
Allows graphic reports 
Display counter for outgoing 
calls
Display counter for incoming 
calls
Display counter for missed 
calls
Calls statistics for selected 
day 
Duration statistic for selected 
day 
Waiting time statistic for 
selected day
Missed calls statistic for 
selected day
Display ACD statistic in 
“Tray Icons” 
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          Graphic reports
 
 

 Display number of calls 
 
 Display duration of calls

 
 

          At a Glance 

 Install and configure in less 
than 15 min. 

 Universal Call Accounting 
format

 Recognizes all telecom 
providers 

 Edit dial number and CLIP 
 Recognizes international calls 

FIX and MOBIL 
 Licensing on the number of 

extensions – best price for 
purchasing

 Allows indirect telecom 
providers (with access code)

 Allows calls charge in 
multiple currencies

 Customized reports 
 TCT clients (for all licensed 

extensions) 
 ACD clients

 
          Next in TCT V3.0 
 
 

Ribbon style interface
CTI integration 
“Click and dial” TCT clients
Real time information for ACD
clients 
Graphic reports 

 


